
Hughes, Timothy 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: 

Michael Taylo 
Tuesday, 28 February 20 2 2:05 P 
lan Wallace 
Murray, Mick; Hughes, Timothy; Rob 
RE: 

I have not done the work yet, that is not the issue. 

I am saying that YOU are in breach of our contract by not doing the works. 

You pay me the $7000 i will no longer hold you responsible for the landscaping,front fence,fence painting. I arrange 
the work myself. 

looks like we are going to the courts. 

Subject: RE: RE: 
Date: Tue, 28 Feb 2012 05:25:48 +0000 

Mr Taylor 
I will inspect the work you have claimed for on Thursday this week and report back to you after the weekend. 
Regards 
lan Wallace 

From: Michael 
Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2012 12:11 PM 
To: Ian Wallace 
Cc: mick Murray; thughes@parliament.wa.gov.au; Rob 
Subject: RE: 

Hi, 

Still no payment. 

Pay me the sum of $7000 in respect of our contract on-The Tuarts Dalyellup, or i will take legal action to 
recover the money in the courts. 

Regards 

Mike Taylor 

Supp Info (Item D) - 28 Feb 2012




