
LG301* 

CAT ACT 2012 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Gosnells 

CAT AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2015 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995, the Cat Act 2012, 
and under all other powers enabling it, the Council of the City of Gosnells resolved 
on 28 July 2015 to make the following local law. 

PART 1—PRELIMINARY 

1.1 Title 

This local law may be cited as the City of Gosnells Cat Amendment Local Law 2015. 

1.2 Commencement 

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the 
Government Gazette. 

1.3 Purpose and effect 

(1) The purpose of this local law is to amend the City of Gosnells Cat Local 
Law 2014. 

(2) The effect of this local law is to correct two minor errors in the City of Gosnells 
Cat Local Law 2014. 

1.4 Principal local law amended 

This local law amends the City of Gosnells Cat Local Law 2014 as published in the 
Government Gazette on 13 January 2015.  

1.5 City of Gosnells Cat Local Law 2014 amended 

(1) In clause 2.2 after the word “Penalty” delete “$1,000” and insert “$2,000” 

(2) In clause 2.7 after the word “Penalty” delete “$1,000” and insert “$2,000” 

(3) In the column headed “CLAUSE” of the table of modified penalties in Schedule 3, 
delete the text “2.6” and insert “2.7” 

———— 

Dated: 31 July 2015. 

The Common Seal of the City of Gosnells was affixed by authority of a resolution of 
the Council in the presence of— 

DAVID GRIFFITHS, Mayor. 
IAN COWIE, Chief Executive Officer. 


